From: Mace, Jon

To: Eoster, Tillman

Cc: Roberts, Karen

Subject: RE: Notification regarding facility fee filing
Date: Tuesday, August 02, 2016 3:59:16 PM

Hi Tillman,

Yes that would be true. Gaylord Hospital, Inc. would be the only entity that would have facility
charges.

Thanks,
Jon Mace

Controller
Gaylord Hospital

P:203-741-3324
F:203-284-8707

Email: jmace@gaylord.org

From: Foster, Tillman [mailto:Tillman.Foster@ct.gov]
Sent: Monday, August 01, 2016 10:04 AM

To: Mace, Jon

Cc: Roberts, Karen

Subject: Notification regarding facility fee filing

Hi Jon — just in follow up, when you say “Gaylord Hospital, Inc. does not charge/bill facility

fees for outpatient services at any of its off campus locations”, can you confirm or clarify
that this includes the Gaylord Farm Association, Inc. system as a whole.

Thanks.
Tillman

Tillman Foster

Associate Health Care Analyst
Department of Public Health
Office of Health Care Access
410 Capitol Avenue

MS #13HCA, P.O. Box 340308
Hartford, CT 06134

Phone: (860) 418-7031

Fax: (860) 418-7053

Email: Tillman.Foster@CT.GOV
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From: Mace, Jon [mailto:jmace@gaylord.org]
Sent: Friday, July 29, 2016 3:45 PM

To: User, OHCA

Cc: Tedesco, Art; Witek, Lorraine

Subject: Notification regarding facility fee filing

To Who it my concern,

Per your request in the email sent to our facility on July 25™ 2016 on behalf of Kimberly R. Martone,
Director of Operations at OHCA, | am submitting this following notification. At this time Gaylord
Hospital, Inc. does not charge/bill facility fees for outpatient services at any of its off campus locations.
Please let me know if you have any questions or require any further information.

Sincerely,

Jon Mace

Controller
Gaylord Hospital

P:203-741-3324
F:203-284-8707

Email: jmace@gaylord.org
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